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tion, Mr Nick Moughtin, added,
"We encouraged them to 'aim
high and get involved'; they
seized the opportunities to be re-
sponsible for their own learning,
pursuing and developing their
interests and passions beyond
the academics." 0
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SJI's top International Baccalaureate Diploma Programme students jump for joy. Ben Ng, who attained a perfect score, is fourth from right.

SJI excels in International Baccalaureate exams
St Joseph's Institution's Class of
2016 International Baccalaureate
Diploma Programme (IBDP) stu-
dents have performed well in the
November 2016 examinations.

According to the Catholic
independent school, all 80 stu-
dents from its third IBDP cohort

passed their exams, and achieved
an average score of 41.5 out of
45 points. This is higher than the
average score of 40. 7 attained by
its Class of 2015, the 2016 na-
tional average of 38.27 and the
global average of 29.21.

The Class of 2016 also pro-

duced SIT's first perfect scorer -
Ben Ng - since the IBDP started
in 2013. In addition, 10 students
had a near perfect score of 44
points, and 84 percent (67 out of
80) students attained at least 40
points out of 45.

"We are very proud of our

third batch of IBDP students
who have graduated with stun-
ning results," said SIT principal,
Fr (Dr) Adrian Danker, SJ. "We
are confident that they are well
prepared for their next phase of
education beyond SIT."

The head of SIT's senior sec-


